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Chiropractic: Big Winners for 2007 
 
DICK TYLER DC, Chair CA Board of 
Chiropractic Examiners, for cleaning 
house from anti chiropractic personnel and 
taking heaps of abuse from partisan 
legislators. 
 

Chiropractor of the Year 

 
Dick Tyler 

 
More Winners: 
 
MARC WEISS DC, Torrance, for winning 
Bautista vs. Reznichek. [3/21/07] winning 
$111,765 because of careful DC 
management and proving the knee injury 
was related to the accident.  
 
SHARON MARTINEZ, DC Rancho 
Cucamonga [4/21/07] winning Howell vs. 
Yellow Freight Systems [4/12/07] a 
$1,000,000 verdict. Again first doctor to see 
patient. Martinez referred to appropriate 
MD’s proving serious back injuries.  
 
APRIL LOPEZ DC, Anaheim winning 
Irvin vs. Salas a $160,000 verdict [6/5/07] 
When April noted patient’s right leg was 
numb and proved it. 

 
 
BRIAN IRVINE DC, Major VF Pioneer, 
Hermosa Beach, winning two major cases 
this year. 1/12/07 Pavlik vs. Parker 
$289.884 and 11/05/07 Moody vs. Valiente 
$ 250,000.00 [both published here].  
 
GAIL RAMSEY DC, Glendale, for 
creating a team of excellent MD’s that 
won $713,926 for Kiker vs. Tax Express, 
10/18/07 in Riverside.  
 
CCA for organizing chiropractors against 
SB 801  that would have set back 
chiropractic 77 years, by abolishing the 
Chiropractic Act of 1922.  
 
CHARLES DAVIS DC of the ICAC for 
excellent leadership defending DC’s 
against SB 801.  
 
 

 
 

http://www.shawnsteel.com/�
mailto:shawnsteel@shawnsteel.com�

